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17-0018

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449 3
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 o 0 %
TABULATION OF BIDS %‘, <EE R _
(183
PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Polyethylene Wrapping/ E § ﬁ %
FOR: Polyvinyl Tape S c g £
TME & (January 1, 2018 through December 31, 2018) 25 2 §
DATE: 3:00 p.m., October 31, 2017 Tad a
SO & -
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY L. oo »n Y4
2,500 Rolls Price 4.90
2 x 10 Mil Pipe Tape, Size 2" x 100", color black, SAWS #16516 TOTAL 12,250.00 NO BID
Manufacturer M. Winmore
1. Model Model
150 Rolls Price 14.80
6 x 10 Mil Pipe Tape, Size 6" x 100", color black, SAWS #16517 TOTAL 2,220.00 NO BID
Manufacturer Mfr. Winmore
2. Model Model
30,000 feet Price 0.71
Poly Wrap, Size 27", Thickness 12 Mil, color black, SAWS #16926 |TOTAL 21,300.00 NO BID
Manufacturer M. Mountain States
27x200 12 Mil
Model Model Black Printed
3. Quantity Description Description
2,000 feet Price 0.55
Poly Wrap, Size 27", Thickness 8 Mil, color purple, used for TOTAL 1,100.00 NO BID
recycled water, material type polyethylene, SAWS #16927
Manufacturer Mfr. Mountain States
27x200 8 Mil
Model Model Purple Printed
4, Quantity Description Description
40 rolls Price 165.40
Poly Wrap, Size 42", Thickness 8 Mil, SAWS #33449 TOTAL 6,616.00 NO BID
Manufacturer M. Mountain States
Model Model 42x200 Black Printed
5. Quantity Description Description
40 rolls Price 70.00
Wrap, Black Poly Sheet 20 ft x 100 ft x 4 ML, SAWS #17563 TOTAL 2,800.00 NO BID
Manufacturer Mfr. Poly Amer.
Model Model CF0420B
6. Quantity Description Description
1,500 feet Price
Lubricant, Pipe Joint (a.k.a. flax soap), Size Quart, Mfr. Black Swan, |Each 4.15
7. Mfr. Part No. 4055, SAWS #13686 TOTAL 6,225.00 NO BID
400 ea. Price
Lubricant, Pipe Joint (a.k.a. flax soap), Size 8 Pound Tub Each 10.83
8. Mfr. CSR/Delta Pipe Products, Mfr. Part No. C1-A, SAWS #13687 |TOTAL 4,332.00 NO BID
*
TOTAL FOR ITEMS 1-8 TOTAL 56,843.00 NO BID
EXTENSION 1 56,843.00
EXTENSION 2 56,843.00
EXTENSION 3 56,843.00
EXTENSION 4 56,843.00
Net
Terms 30 days
Delivery Days 10-14 days
*LOW BIDDER
BIDS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Act Pipe Gajeske Demandstar
AY McDonald Hydro Solutions SAWS Website
Cohen Pipe KLP Commercial
Core and Main Milford Online
Corix MS Techline Pipe
Ferguson Scruggs
Fortiline




